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3 January 2021 
 
The Supreme Pontiff of Hinduism 

Jagatguru Mahasannidhanam 

His Divine Holiness Bhagavan Sri Nithyananda Paramashivam 

KAILASA Nation 
 

Your Divine Holiness, 
 

It is my pleasure and privilege to congratulate the 44th Jayanthi Anniversary of The Supreme 
Pontiff of Hinduism, Jagatguru Mahasannidhanam, His Divine Holiness Bhagavan Sri 
Nithyananda Paramashivam, recognized as the 1008th living incarnation of Paramashiva as per 
Hinduism by His predecessors of enlightened masters and adepts. 

The Supreme Pontiff of Hinduism is ordained as the 1008th Acharya Mahamandaleshwar (the 
head for all spiritual leaders) of Atal Akhada (ancient apex body of Hinduism), coronated as 
Mahamandaleshwar (Supreme Spiritual Head) of Maha Nirvani Akhada, largest apex monastic 
order, becoming the youngest Mahamandaleshwar, ordained as the 23rd Guru Mahasannidhanam 
(Pontiff) of Thondai Mandala Aadheenam, present 293rd Guru Mahasannidhanam (Pontiff) of 
Shyamalapeeta Sarvajnapeetam,  present 22nd Guru Mahasannidhanam of Dharmamukthi 
Swargapuram Aadheenam and the incumbent Emperor of Suryavamsa Surangi Samrajyam.  

His Divine Holiness Sri Nithyananda Paramashivam as The Supreme Pontiff of Hinduism, the 
head of KAILASA Nation and the head of Sovereign Order of KAILASA has worked tirelessly for 
the past 40 years - despite enduring and surviving more than two decades of relentless social, 
political, intellectual, religious, cultural, linguistic, economic, legal, digital persecution - for 
the  revival of the ancient sciences of Vedas and Agamas (Hindu scriptures) using the 
technologies of Yoga, Ayurveda (Science of Herbal Medicine), Dhyana (Meditation) and 
Pranayama (breath control) throughout the world to develop human beings consciously - 
irrespective of nationality, religion, race, gender or economic status - in improving their physical, 
mental, emotional, economic and spiritual well-being.. KAILASA, as a borderless nation, with de 
facto spiritual embassies operating in over 100 countries, including the United States of America, 
and having presence across the globe as the largest spiritual knowledge source on Hinduism and 
having enriched and enreached more than one billion individuals over for the past 26 years and 
as such also had a significant impact over Luxembourg.    
 

In the Year of 2021, we rejoice in the 44th Jayanthi Celebrations of The Supreme Pontiff of 
Hinduism, Jagatguru Mahasannidhanam, His Divine Holiness Bhagavan Nithyananda 
Paramashivam. I thank The Supreme Pontiff of Hinduism for His contribution to Hinduism and 
Luxembourg and look forward to cultivating this strong and lasting relationship for many years to 
come.    
 

My life has deeply transformed since the time I was introduced to His Divine Holiness Sri 
Nithyananda Paramashivam (or as we fondly call him Swamiji) in October 2017. Since then I 
have experienced huge breakthroughs and healings in every aspect of my life – my health, 
relationships, wealth and personal wellbeing. With powerful cognitions through Swamiji’s various 
energy initiations and spiritual programs, my life keeps on getting easier and all the best things 
flow to me effortlessly as I am vibrating in a high-energy space. Swamiji keeps on inspiring me to 
be the best version of me always and to go on sharing this sacred knowledge with humanity and 
enrich them. I offer my deepest gratitude to Swamiji and I am blessed to have him as my Guru. 
 

Very Respectfully, 

Nikunj Sanghavi - Senior HR Professional  


